
 

An example of responses issued under the Freedom of Information Act in May 2017 

Ref 
Number  

Date 
Received  

Applicant  Information Requested and Response  

306.17 25.04.17 Individual 1.Do you have any provision for providing benefits, legal or welfare information to patients on trauma or 

other wards? 

Each service provides information that is relevant to that condition; most will signpost to a charity.  

2.Do you have a legal, signposting, rehabilitation or welfare clinic on site? 

Yes, we have the following available on site; 

•General information leaflets available within the PALS office which will signpost to public bodies or 

charities. 

•Cancer information centre within Oncology outpatients which will signpost to other services. 

•The ‘one place’ based near the main hospital entrance is a central advice and information hub used 

currently to see members of the public/patients by; Carers Trust, Disability Cambridgeshire, Macmillan 

and Relate. 

3.Have you entered into a formal agreement with any company or charity to provide the above? If so 

who? 

There is no central agreement with any company. 

For charities CUH uses a memorandum of understanding prior to them coming on to site - please see the 

attached Document.  

The PALS office may also offer the attached ‘AvMA leaflet’ to patients if this is felt relevant. 

4.When does the agreement start and end and who signed the agreement on behalf of the trust and 

provider? 

Not applicable. 

5.What benefits or income does the Trust/department receive? 

None. 

6.Are there any companies advertising on the patient information given out for signposting/legal advice 

No. 

7.Does the agreement have a clause excluding any claims to be made against the trust? 

Not applicable.  

 

308.17 21.04.17 Individual 1.Does the Trust provide a packed lunch/dinner to patients discharged before/during mealtimes? 

We have a going home’ package for vulnerable patients that are identified by the clinical teams where 

the patient may not have food at home as they live on their own. 

2.If yes, please give an example of the contents of the meal. 

Sandwich, Fruit, Yogurt and Cake. 

3.Are the meals provided under a PFI arrangement? If so, is this a separate contract, or linked to a wider 

catering/other contract? 

No, forms part of an out-sourced catering contract. 

4.Please give the value of the contract to provide packed lunches for the last year figures are available. 

If part of a wider contract, please estimate the proportion of the contract which covers packed lunches. 

In 12 months we have provided 383 snack boxes at £2.50 per box, which is equivalent to 1% of the food 

supply contract. 

5.How many packed lunch/dinner meals were provided during the year 2015/16? 

 



360 on average. 

6.Please calculate an average cost for providing each meal.  

£2.50 

322.17 02.05.17 Media 1.Could you tell me the cost of feeding one inpatient per day (patient meal day) calculated in the same 

way it is done for the ERIC data.  

http://hefs.hscic.gov.uk/ERIC.asp 

I would like the average daily cost for the provision of all meals and beverages fed to one inpatient per 

day. The cost should include all pay and non-pay, including provisions, ward issues, disposables, 

equipment and its maintenance. This is not the average cost for a single meal but for all meals and 

beverages delivered to the patients in one day. Please supply the latest possible data 2016/17. 

£9.01 

2.Could you tell me the number of wasted meal servings using the same calculation methods used in the 

ERIC reporting system. Although this figure is no longer included in the ERIC reporting I would still like 

to see latest figures. Please supply up to date figures including 2017. For plated meal systems, this is 

the number (calculated over the full menu cycle or 7 days where no menu cycle is used), of unserved in-

patient meals remaining at the end of the meals service period expressed as a percentage of the total 

number of meals provided and available at the commencement of the meal service period.  

We are currently running at 11.04% wastage on bulk cook chill meals. 

Plated meals are frozen and cooked to order therefore the wastage is 0% 

 

324.17 02.05.17 Commercial 1.Please provide list of nursing agencies currently utilised for nursing and care staff at the trust. 

Medsol Healthcare, Nursing 2000, Med Pure, DRC, TFS . 

The Trust does not use agencies for Healthcare support workers. 

2.Please provide spend data for nursing and care agencies across all areas of the trust for qualified staff 

dated April 2016 - April 2017. 

£256,000 

3.Please provide information of which off framework agencies supplied nursing staff dated between April 

2016 - April 2017 including spend data. 

None used. 

 

329.17 08.05.17 Individual Has your hospital discontinued provision of hip precautions and/or assistive devices/equipment such as 

raised toilet seats, long-handled aids, long-handled shoe horns, sock-aids, long-handled sponges, bath 

benches, wedge pillows and perching stools to patients following total hip replacement (THR)? 

Addenbrooke’s Hospital are currently following hip precautions with patients following Total Hip 

Replacements and are therefore providing the necessary equipment to support the precautions. We loan 

equipment such as combined toilet seat and frames, bed raisers, perch stools etc. if required, but 

patients have to buy their own long handled aids.  

 

338.17 11.05.17 Media  1.How many people have turned up to A&E with an alcohol-related condition/emergency at Cambridge 

University Hospitals within the last three years? Please could you break this number down year by year 

so I can see if there has been a rise. 

 

Year A/E Attendances    

2014/2015 331 

2015/2016 386 

2016/2017 371 

 



2.How much alcohol-related hospital admissions are costing the hospital? 

 

 

 

Alcohol related disorders £10200171 

  Alcoholic liver disease £6159175 

  Toxic effect of alcohol £431413 
 

350.17 19.05.17 Individual 1.How many FOI requests have been received by your trust on a year by year basis for the past 5 years? 

2012 = 508 

2013 = 646 

2014 = 695 

2015 = 728 

2016 = 842 

2.How many of the FOI requests have breached the 20 working day limit stipulated by the act in the 

past 5 years? 

2012 = 9 

2013 = 19 

2014 = 75 

2015 = 89 

2016 = 76 

3.How many times were your trust were reported to the ICO because of breaches and if they issued 

fines/how much, etc - for past 5 years? 

There have been no incidents of ICO intervention in relation to ‘breaches’. 

4.Please can you able to advise how long the average FOI request takes to complete? 

This information is not recorded. 

5.Please can you advise the minimum time and cost and the maximum time and cost of an FOI request? 

This information is not recorded. 

6.Please can you advise how many staff you have in your department working on FOI requests and 

WTE? 

1.5 WTE band 4 

1 WTE band 6 

1 WTE band 8b 

Please note - all of the above posts do not just deal with FOI requests but have other responsibilities. 

7.Please can you confirm what computer systems do you your to manage your FOIs, (Citrix, Proteus, 

etc)? 

Microsoft Word and Excel. 

8.What is your estimated cost in terms of consultant time, admin staff, secs, managers spent on FOI 

requests? 

This information is not recorded. 

 

354.17 22.05.17 Commercial 1.Within your trust how many intra-vitreal vials/implants have been used in the latest 4 months, if  



possible between January and April 2017? 

2.Please state the number of vials dispensed from your pharmacy in this period, if the number for wet 

AMD is not known, then regardless of reason for use. 

Lucentis (ranibizumab) Injections  

Avastin (bevacizumab) Injections  

Eylea (aflibercept) Injections  

Illuvien (Fluocinolone) Impants  

Ozudex (Dexamethasone) Implants 

Total Vials / Implants          

Vials / Implants for Wet Age Related Macular Degeneration (wAMD)           

 

Please see the table below to show our response to the above questions; 

  

 Jan 2017 Feb 2017 March 2017 April 2017 

Ranibuzumab  

Wet AMD 

indication 

89 49 83 24 

Bevacizumab 

intravitreal 

injection – 

unclear of 

indication 

0 2 2 0 

Aflibercept Wet 

AMD Indication 

90 51 38 49 

Fluocinolone 

Implants 

0 0 0 0 

Dexamethasone 

Implants 

0 0 0 2 ( indication unclear) 

 

 

 


