
 
An example of responses issued under the Freedom of Information Act in January  2019 

Ref 

Number  
Date 

Received  

Applicant  Information Requested and Response  

843.18 06.12.18 Individual  1. Does your Trust use an electronic system to record and manage clinical and non-clinical incidents including 

patient safety incidents? 

Yes 

2. If yes to question 1, what is the name of the system you use to record and manage clinical and non-clinical 

incidents within the Trust? 

Datix Web 

3. In relation to the system named in question 2, do you use the system for any other functions other than 

the reporting and management of incidents? 

Yes 

4. If yes to question 3, could you please detail what additional functions the system is used for (i.e complaints 

management and risk management)? 

Risk Management, PALS and Complaints, Claims, Clinical Audit and Safety Alerts 

5.Could you please provide the cost of the system named in question 2 for the last financial year (2017/18)? 

2017/18: £38,854.53 excluding VAT 

6. If possible, could you please provide the cost of the system named in question 2 for the last 5 financial 

years? 

The System has only been in use since 2015 so we are only able to provide three years data  

17/18: £38,854.53 

16/17: £79,128.92 

15/16:£43,598.45  

848.18 07.12.18 Other NHS FOI MONTHLY STATS 

1. How many FOI requests were received by your Trust each month between 1 April 2018 and 30 November 

2018? 

April-87 

May-79 

June -71 

July-100 

August-80 

September -49 

October-76 

November-60 

Total-602 

2. How many FOI requests were responded to by your Trust over the 20 working day  

Information Commissioner’s Office limit each month between 1 April 2018 and 30 November 2018? 



April-9 

May-15 

June -7 

July-10 

August-11 

September -18 

October-18 

November-15 

Total -103 

FOI TRUST RESOURCE 

3. How many staff does your Trust employ to coordinate FOI responses, and what are the normal working 

hours (e.g. Full time, 0.5wte/18 hours per week) 

FOI responsibilities are attached to a number of posts across the whole of the information governance team; 

all of the posts within the team have other duties attached to their role in addition to FOI. We do not hold any 

statistical information as to how much of the team’s time as a whole is spent dealing with FOI requests. 

4. What software solution does your Trust use to manage and log the FOI requests process? (e.g. MS 

Outlook, MS Excel spreadsheets, MS Access databases, Ulysses Request for Information Module, DropPane, 

Datix, paper register) 

MS Excel Spreadsheet  

5.  Is the software used for managing FOI requests the same as that used by your Trust’s Subject Access 

request team? 

No 

TRUST RESOURCES 

6. What is your Trust’s annual overall budget for the current financial year 2018/2019? 

The Trust does not hold this information. 

NHS acute trusts do not have budgets we have income. Budget that is allocated within the trust for each area 

of speciality is driven by the income we receive as a trust and is therefore not defined as a budget 

The Trust does not have a budget. Foundation trusts have ‘budget’ through the income they earn so we can 

only provide actual expenditure we can’t give a budget number.  

7. How many staff overall are employed by your Trust? 

10430 

8. Approximately how many patients come within your Trust’s catchment area? 

As the trust provides health care for both the local community and is a national centre for specialist 

treatment, our catchment area could be anywhere within the country. 

Addenbrooke’s provides emergency, surgical and medical care for local people and is also a regional centre of 

excellence for specialist services such as organ transplantation, neurosciences, paediatrics and genetics.  

Based on the same site, the Rosie is a women’s hospital and the regional centre of excellence for maternity 

care.  



FOI TRAINING 

9. Have your FOI coordination staff attended externally provided training courses on Freedom of Information? 

If so, could you list the provider? 

No they have been trained in house. 

10. Have you run FOI awareness campaigns within your Trust to raise knowledge of legal requirements, and 

change attitudes? For instance, has your Trust invited a speaker from the ICO to give a talk on FOI or Data 

Protection, and was this an effective approach? 

Yes, FOI awareness campaigns are on-going and with regard to whether this was an effective approach this 

part of the question is an opinion which does not fall within the FOI Act . 

850.18 09.12.18 Media  Please could you provide information on the cost per inpatient per day of catering during 2018? 

The cost of feeding one in-patient per day is £9.32. 

852.18 11.12.18 Other-NHS 1. What is your Trusts annual F.C.E (Finished Consultant Episodes)? 

In excess of 245,000 

2. What are your accredited clinical coders (ACC) expected coding input figures?  Per day/per week/per 

month/per year. 

There are no targets for individual coders.  All the clinical coders work as a team to complete to national time 

scales  

3. How many trainee clinical coders do you currently have? 

We have 5 trainees this does not include non ACCs 

4. How many accredited clinical coders (ACC) do you currently have? 

19 

5. How many auditors, trainers and team leaders / deputies do you currently have?  

We have 2 auditors, 2 trainers and 3 team leaders (there are no deputy team leader roles. 

6. What band are your trainee clinical coders? 

Band 4   

7. What band are your ACC’s? 

Band 5+ 

8. What band are your auditors, trainers, team leaders, deputies? 

Auditors - Band 6+, Trainers - Band 6+ Team Leaders - Band 6 and there are no Deputy Team Leader roles 

within the trust. 

9. Do you pay any recruitment and retention (R&R) to your clinical coders?  If so, what percentage/annual 

amount? 

Yes, currently recruitment and retention is £3000 per full time equivalent. 

10. Do you link the IHRIM National Clinical Coding Qualification (NCCQ UK) to a qualification of similar level?  

If so, what level of qualification? 

No 

11. Do your trainers and auditors perform training courses, workshops and audits to clinical coders external 

to your Trust?   



Not currently. 

12. Are your trainers, auditors, team leaders/ deputy’s expected to code?  If so, how often? 

Yes, every month they code but they are not responsible for a coding workload. 

13.  Do your clinical coders perform overtime on a regular basis? If so, how many hours per month? 

No 

14. What is your Trusts coding target for completing the months discharged patients? 

8 working days after the month end 

865.18 14.12.18 Commercial  I am writing to you as I am eager to get some information on your agency locum/locum spend. 

If you could please give me the following information as soon as possible I would be extremely grateful: 

How much did the trust spend on agency locums last year? Broken down into SHO, Middle Grade and 

Consultants 

If I could please have this information on the following specialities: A&E, Acute Medicine, General Medicine, 

Radiology and Paediatrics I would be extremely appreciative 

The only locum agency spends the Trust had last year from the specific list provided was Radiology, 

Consultants of £160,993. 

866.18 17.12.18 Media  I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information. 

Has your NHS trust stockpiled any medication to prepare for a Brexit ‘no-deal’? 

No 

If yes, which types of medication have been stockpiled? 

Not applicable 

If yes, how many weeks’ worth of medication has been stockpiled? 

Not applicable  

868.18 18.12.18 Media  1. How many of your staff are entitled to the free flu vaccine for winter 2018/19? 

10485 Cambridge University Hospitals staff 

2. How many of these are employed in frontline patient-facing roles? 

7885 

3. How many of your staff has received the 2018/19 flu vaccine as of 14-12-18? 

6943 

4. How many of your frontline patient-facing staff have received the 2018/19 flu vaccine as of 14-12-18? 

5918, 75.05% 

5. How many of your staff has been removed from frontline duties because they have not had the vaccine? 

None 

    

 


